
REVELATION BOMB 

I was speaking weeks ago about the release of top secret files as a distraction from 
what is happening with the economy and all of the mess that politics are. As you may or 
may not know, I have been skimming through these fallback narratives that are really 
surprising as they have confirmed some of the conspiracy theories I heard when I was 
in high school.

Fallback narrative stories are revealed or admitted, perhaps through the “accidental” 
release or leak of some documents or by that ever-useful narrative tool, the 
whistleblower. This fallback might even have some admissible semi-truths in it like good 
misinformation always does.

The aim will be as ever –  to let some of the deception fall away, whilst protecting the 
core of the official narrative to provide fodder for frenzied but carefully curated debate. 
No matter how much they claim in congressional hearings that they are revealing stuff,  
they handle it in vague terms making us feel that what we find are various nothing 
burgers in these so-called declassified documents.

But that doesn't mean that they are not satisfactory, especially when It comes to 
conspiracy histories that have been put on the shelf, only to be true according to the 
new fall back narratives that when exposed are controversial.

I understand this is a big risk to take from the establishment point of view because once 
they start allowing that “official stories” can be a patchwork of lies, you invite other 
questions. 

It would also mean playing an ace they’ve had up their sleeve for sometime, but I don’t 
think you can ignore the signs.

The “big revelation” bomb is armed. It is being dropped and if no one is there to see it or 
hear it - it just does not have the impact that most revelation bombs do.

Back in the late 1980's when there was talk that the Soviet Union was going to 
disappear, one of the first things I remember was that The Pravda, the well known 
Soviet newspaper began revealing stories about Hitler surviving World War II and a 
strange story about an alien attack that killed an Army Battalion in the Soviet Union.

I remember being told that this was Soviet propaganda and not to believe what was 
being reported. There was always that saying "Trust But Verify " that was given by 



Reagan with regard to anything that was coming out of the Soviet Union during the end 
of the Cold War.  

I have always said the Cold War conspiracy theory is far more interesting than the stuff 
we talk about today . Maybe it is because I have a penchant for history but what is most 
surprising is when you remember hearing these outrageous conspiracies and then later 
in your life, declassified documents actually provide the information that you remember 
being dismissed as a false report.

Both of the conspiracy theories I have just cited have actually happened according to 
recently declassified documents. 

In a year when we've already been told to brace ourselves for full disclosure on the 
assassinations of JFK, MLK, RFK, on America's UFO program and even the 
government's search for the Ark of the Covenant, perhaps this latest declassification 

effort should come as no surprise. Yet, it does.

Argentinian President Javier Milei announced that Argentina would be declassifying 
government archives related to Nazi activity in an effort to expose how war criminals 
escaped to the country following World War II.

The decision was made during a meeting with representatives from the Simon 
Wiesenthal Center who has championed the fight against antisemitism.

The move will grant researchers, along with the public, access to historical documents 
that may shed new light on the escape networks that helped Nazis evade arrest and 
resettle in South America.

According to The Jewish Chronicle, historians estimate that Argentina offered refuge to 
roughly 5,000 Nazi war criminals, including notorious Nazi figures, Adolf Eichmann and 
Josef Mengele.

The newly released archives could also provide deeper insight into the extent of local 
support that enabled arrival of the fleeing Nazis and their protection.

The declassified documents also has also revealed that Hitler allegedly did not commit 
suicide and continued to live in Bariloche Argentina after World war II.

According to Fox News:

"Argentina is set to declassify all government-held files relating to Nazi fugitives who 
fled and settled in Argentina after World War II, according to reports. 

The documents will likely include Nazi-linked bank accounts and archival records 
detailing the use of Nazi "ratlines" which were monetary and logistic pathways Nazis 

used to escape justice and flee Argentina following the war.”



Guillermo Alberto Francos, Argentina’s interior minister, made the announcement 
Tuesday, the Buenos Aires Times reported citing DNEWS.

It is estimated that up to 10,000 Nazis and other Fascist war criminals escaped justice 
for Holocaust atrocities by fleeing to Argentina and other Latin American countries.

Notorious high-level Nazis, including Holocaust mastermind Adolph Eichmann and 
"Angel of Death" Josef Mengele, fled to the South American country, while rumors have 
swirled for years that former Nazi Party leader Adolf Hitler also ended up there. …

Argentinian President Javier Milei … promised officials of the Simon Wiesenthal Center 
his full cooperation in granting access to the documents. The center is famous for 
tracking down Nazis and is named after the famed Nazi hunter."

It seems as though Fox News is playing it safe by chalking Hitler's escape to Argentina 
as swirling "rumors." Which is their prerogative. But not everyone sees it as the stuff of 
mere rumors. And are anticipating nothing less than hard evidence that Hitler  managed 
to do what he prevented tens of millions around the world from doing in the 1930s 
through 1945. Which was live peacefully to a ripe old age.

It has been reported that documents confirming Hitler’s survival, escape to Argentina 
with US aid, living into the 1960’s, and sired two daughters. 

This mission was allegedly called "Operation Eagle Flight."

Rather than commit suicide on April 30th,1945 as the Soviet Red Army was closing in 
on his bunker, Hitler and Eva Braun were already gone. They'd used an escape tunnel 
to the subway, then to a plane that was standing by for them. All arranged by Martin 
Bormann.

The flight took them to Denmark. Then to the Baltics. Then to Spain, where the 
government was paid off with Nazi gold. Then the Canary Islands, where they got on 
board Nazi submarine – a U-518, which was designed with battery life enough to cross 
the Atlantic round trip on a single charge. 

U-518 was supposedly sunk by the Allies, but no sign of its destruction was ever 
recovered or even spotted. Later a Police Commissioner in Argentina reported it was 
spotted along the coast, but he was ordered to disregard the eyewitness accounts. 
Then in 2022, researchers found an identical make and model U-Boat sunk in the very 
spot witnesses said they saw subs being scuttled, dove the site and positively identified 
it as U-518. But was told that was just a rock formation. 

Bormann's plan had included a phase code named "Operation Land of Fire" which 
consisted of a "secret paradise" German village in Patagonia. The Argentine President 



then was Juan Peron, the husband of Evita.  The Perons were all too happy to assist 
the Nazis, before he himself was overthrown. 

Much of this was always talked about in Argentine tabloids -- the legends and rumors 
did not go away and has been selling newspapers for decades.

Not long after Germany's surrender, the OSS (the Department of War's precursor to the 
CIA) decoded a message from Bormann to Argentina: "The package arrives." Now, 
that's not definitive proof he was talking about Hitler. But given all the time, effort, and 
investment that went into building the infrastructure of the place, it's not out of the realm 
of possibility. 

Next, there are plenty of eyewitness accounts of people who not only saw, but met and 
spoke with an aging Fuhrer. A maid. A hotel owner. A gardener. A farmer. A shopkeeper. 
They could've all been wrong about meeting the single most recognizable person of the 
20th century. But do the math. 

Now in the recent declassification of the JFK documents, we learn more about the 
situation.

JFK assassination documents include a 1955 CIA document where an asset reports a 
former SS Officer telling him Hitler was still alive. And the file includes a photo of Hitler 
alive and well.

Among those convinced that Hitler not only escaped, but did so with help from the US 
was Stalin. Though the Russians did claim to have parts of his skull. A few years ago, 
that bone fragment was tested and turned out to have the DNA of a woman in her 40s. 
They still claim to have his jaw, but after the embarrassment of that big reveal, the 
testing is pretty much over.

Furthermore, there is another declassified document from these recent revelations 
about the other story that was front page in the Pravda in 1989.

The bone-chilling document declassified by the CIA has exposed an alleged massacre 
by aliens from a crashed UFO who turned an entire military unit into stone.

According to the report, Soviet troops shot down a flying saucer hovering over the 
Soviet military unit in Siberia and what happened next was truly terrifying.

In the document, summarizing a 250-page top secret file acquired by US intelligence 
agents, eyewitnesses said five aliens climbed out of their wrecked craft, combined 
themselves into one creature, exploded in a burst of intense energy, and turned 23 
soldiers into solid rock.

One CIA official referred to the shocking battle as 'a horrific picture of revenge on the 
part of extraterrestrial creatures, a picture that makes one's blood freeze.' 



The agency added that the 'extremely menacing case' proved the aliens who visited 
Earth possessed weapons and technology far beyond the US government's 
'assumptions' suggesting they were already aware of the aliens' existence.

The 23 'petrified soldiers' could not be saved. Their remains and the debris from the 
spacecraft were reportedly moved to a secret research base near Moscow.

An even more concerning detail of the CIA file is the description of the aliens reportedly 
involved in this massacre, who have been mentioned in UFO reports and sightings for 
nearly 80 years.

The subject of the document states: 'Paper reports alleged evidence on mishap 
involving UFO.'

This extraordinary tale was also published in the Ukrainian newspaper Holos Ukrayiny 
on March 27, 1993.

The incident, which a Canadian newspaper believed took place between 1989 and 
1990, was only uncovered by the CIA after the fall of the Soviet Union and its 'secret 
police' organization, the KGB. 

The CIA document explained that the alleged alien craft was flying low and quietly 
above the Soviet union while they were engaged in a training mission.

Officials wrote that 'for unknown reasons' the Soviets launched a surface-to-air missile 
at the UFO, sending it crashing to the Earth near the unit's position.

According to the only two soldiers who survived, when the soldiers approached the 
craft, the five aliens freed themselves of the debris and came close together near the 
wreck.

Moments later, the soldiers said the group of aliens 'merged into a single object that 
acquired a spherical shape.' In simpler language, the aliens beings somehow morphed 
into a giant ball.

That’s when the new ball-like alien entity began to buzz and hiss before igniting into a 
brilliant white light.

With the soldiers still looking on, the ball of light erupted like a giant flare of energy, 
turning 23 of the 25 Soviets into 'stone poles.'

The report stated that the only reason two of the men survived was because they were 
standing in a shaded area at the time of the alien energy blast.

Testing of the soldier's bodies showed the alien flare had somehow changed living 
tissue into a substance that closely resembles limestone.



Even in 2025, the science behind such a shocking transformation is still difficult to 
explain medically and technologically.

According to the Journal of Applied Physics, it is possible to use high-energy radiation 
or electromagnetic pulses to change normal matter into plasma - a form that's not a 
liquid, solid, or gas. In the report, the CIA described the aliens as short humanoids with 
'large heads and large black eyes.'

The account matches who UFO researchers, alleged alien abductees, and others who 
believe in alien life refer to as a race called 'the Greys.'

Despite their prominent place in extraterrestrial research, this disturbing incident 
appears to be the first time humans have alleged that these beings could have 
accomplished such terrifying feats.

We have always been told that aliens have never harmed anyone -- but in this case it 
sounds like a revenge attack. 

The most unappealing outcomes would arise if extraterrestrials caused harm to 
humanity, even if by accident. While aliens may arrive to eat, enslave or attack us, the 
report adds that people might also suffer from being physically crushed or by 
contracting diseases carried by the visitors. In especially unfortunate incidents, 
humanity could be wiped out when a more advanced civilization accidentally unleashes 
an unfriendly artificial intelligence, or performs a catastrophic physics experiment that 
renders a portion of the galaxy uninhabitable.

I know that it is extreme but so is the idea that aliens are in anyway saviors for us to 
wait for.

Life does not seem to include a Deus Ex Machina but who knows? 

Extraterrestrials may be wary of civilizations that expand very rapidly, as these may be 
prone to destroy other life as they grow, just as humans have pushed species to 
extinction on Earth. In the most extreme scenario, aliens might choose to destroy 
humanity to protect other civilizations.

It is obvious or at least it is being declassified that our contact with extraterrestrials, 
need us to seriously consider the potential scenarios that may help to plot the future 
path of human civilization, avoid collapse and achieve long-term survival.


